
Satyanarayana Reddy <satya.zeal@gmail.com>

RE: Reg quotation for Statease sofware ( license activation key code and TAX Invoice)
1 message

SYSTECH-(ACCOUNTS & RENEWALS) <anand@systech.co.in> Fri, Apr 22, 2016 at 2:25 PM
To: V V S Narayana Reddy K <satya.zeal@gmail.com>
Cc: Jitesh T Dave <jitesh@systech.co.in>

Dear Prof. V.V.S. Narayana,

 

As yet we haven’t received the payment.

 

Our Invoice

STSPL/367/15-16

Dated

15.03.2016

PO

Mail Confirmation 28,381.25

 

Kindly acknowledge update on the status of payment immediately.

 

With Regards

Anand B. Salunke

Manager (Accounts & Renewals)

 

SYSTECH TECHNOCRAFT SERVICES PVT LTD

Reg. Office: A-102 Sukh Angan Ashish Complex Mira Road Thane 401107

Tel.: +91-22-65103242 / 42 644 858 (Tel)

+91 959 474 2722 (Mobile)

+91 222  288 62323 (Fax)

anand@systech.co.in

 

 

From: SYSTECH-(ACCOUNTS & RENEWALS) [mailto:anand@systech.co.in]
Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2016 12:07 PM
To: 'V V S Narayana Reddy K' <satya.zeal@gmail.com>
Cc: 'Jitesh T Dave' <jitesh@systech.co.in>
Subject: RE: Reg quota�on for Statease sofware ( license ac�va�on key code and TAX Invoice)

 

Dear Prof. V.V.S Narayana

 

Thanks for your mail confirmation PO for Design Expert V-10 Software,

 

Please find attached Design Expert license activation key code (packing slip) and TAX invoice, below DOWNLOAD Link in trail
mail for the same

mailto:anand@systech.co.in
mailto:anand@systech.co.in
mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com
mailto:jitesh@systech.co.in


 

As informed hardcopy of TAX Invoice sent to the following address through DTDC Courier

 

The Principal, 

JSS COLLEGE OF PHARMACY

(JSS University),

Mysore) Udhagamandalam- 643 001.

Kindly Attn. Dr. K. Gowthamarajan

Appreciate if you can acknowledge and send the DD to the following signature address immediately

Please Note: TDS Will not be applicable, NO TDS is to be deducted on this invoice as per

Notification No. 21/2012 [F No. 142/10/2012-SO (TPL)]S.O.1323 (E) dated 13.06.2012

 

With Regards

Anand B. Salunke

Manager (Accounts & Renewals)

 

SYSTECH TECHNOCRAFT SERVICES PVT LTD

Reg. Office: A-102 Sukh Angan Ashish Complex Mira Road Thane 401107

Tel.: +91-22-65103242 / 42 644 858 (Tel)

+91 959 474 2722 (Mobile)

+91 222  288 62323 (Fax)

anand@systech.co.in

 

Dr.K. Gowthamaraja

JSS College of Pharmacy

Udhagamandalam,  643 001

INDIA

 

Dear Dr. Gowthamaraja:

 

Thank you for purchasing Design-Expertâ software. We hope you will find it a valuable tool in your work. 

 

Please keep this e-mail handy because it has important information you may need again in the future. Your license is serial number 0833-1368-4048-
0583. You can download your Single-User software and documentation from our web site using the appropriate link below.

mailto:anand@systech.co.in


 

Design-Expert: http://www.statease.com/software/dx.html

Design-Ease: http://www.statease.com/software/de.html

 

For help getting started, please refer to the Getting Started documentation on the web site at the Downloadable Files tab. You can download useful
tutorials and tours to guide you through the software at the Tutorials tab. (And, for immediate answers to your support questions, check out the
frequently asked questions (FAQs) on the Stat-Ease User Forum at http://forum.statease.com/.)

 

For electronic distribution installations there are shortcuts added to the Stat-Ease group in the Start menu: Register Design-Expertâ 10 and Design-

Expertâ 10 Read Me. The first is the utility for registering your software and the second includes installation notes. You can also register the software
online by going to http://statease.com/software/dx-register.html. As a thank you for registering the software, you will be sent the Handbook for
Experimenters: A Concise Collection of Handy Tips to Help You Set Up and Analyze Your Designed Experiments at no charge.

 

New single-user licenses come with 12 months of Annual Service and Maintenance (ASM) for free. Thereafter ASM is renewable on a yearly basis at
22% of the then current price. ASM includes free updates, upgrades, and technical support. Annual licenses are renewable yearly and also include free
updates, upgrades, and technical support as long as the license is current.

 

To ensure that you receive notification of updates or upgrades, plus other valuable information on DOE, please take a minute to review and correct
the information following:

 

End-User Info

Dr. K. Gowthamaraja

JSS University, Mysore

JSS College of Pharmacy

Udhagamandalam,  643 001

INDIA

gowthamsang@gmail.com

E-mail any changes to info@statease.com or fax them back to us at 612.378.2152 at your earliest convenience. To sign up for our monthly DOE
FAQ Alert e-mail newsletter (vital for staying informed on the latest developments), please go to http://statease.com/doealertreg.html. Sign up for our
Stat-Teaser newsletter at http://www.statease.com/publications/maillist.html.

 

 

From: SYSTECH TECHNOCARFT SERVICE PVT LTD [mailto:sales@systech.co.in]
Sent: Wednesday, March 02, 2016 4:50 PM
To: 'V V S Narayana Reddy K' <satya.zeal@gmail.com>
Cc: 'Jitesh T Dave' <jitesh@systech.co.in>; 'systech' <anand@systech.co.in>
Subject: RE: Reg quota�on for Statease sofware

 

Dear Narayana,

 

As discussed, please find  a�ached revised Proforma Invoice for Design-Expert so�ware.

 

Appreciate if you can acknowledge for same.

 

http://www.statease.com/software/dx.html
http://www.statease.com/software/de.html
http://forum.statease.com/
http://statease.com/software.html
mailto:gowthamsang@gmail.com
mailto:info@statease.com
http://statease.com/doealertreg.html
http://www.statease.com/publications/maillist.html
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mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com
mailto:jitesh@systech.co.in
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Regards,

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: V V S Narayana Reddy K [mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, March 02, 2016 4:35 PM
To: SYSTECH TECHNOCARFT SERVICE PVT LTD <sales@systech.co.in>
Subject: Re: Reg quota�on for Statease sofware

 

Dear Sir,

Thank you very much for swift reply.

Small corrections:

Billing address to: The Principal,  JSS COLLEGE OF PHARMACY (JSS University, Mysore) Udhagamandalam- 643 001.
Kindly Attn. Dr. K. Gowthamarajan.

Waiting for your ealry reply.

Best Regards

 

On Wed, Mar 2, 2016 at 12:49 PM, SYSTECH TECHNOCARFT SERVICE PVT LTD <sales@systech.co.in> wrote:

Dear V.V.S Narayan

 

http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx
http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx
mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com
mailto:sales@systech.co.in
mailto:sales@systech.co.in


As discussed  and required by you please find a�ached Proforma Invoice for Design-Expert so�ware.

 

Appreciate if you can raise PO at earliest.

 

Regards,

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: V V S Narayana Reddy K [mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, March 02, 2016 12:16 PM

To: SYSTECH TECHNOCARFT SERVICE PVT LTD <sales@systech.co.in>
Cc: K GOWTHAMARAJAN <gowthamsang@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Reg quotation for Statease sofware

 

Dear Sir,

Thank you very much for the revised quote.

Kindly provide us the invoice for the purchase of software.

Waiting for your early reply.

Best Regards

http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx
http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx
mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com
mailto:sales@systech.co.in
mailto:gowthamsang@gmail.com


 

On Tue, Mar 1, 2016 at 4:36 PM, SYSTECH TECHNOCARFT SERVICE PVT LTD <sales@systech.co.in> wrote:

Dear Narayana,

 

As discussed the prices for Design-Expert v10 is already discounted for Academic ins�tute.

 

As very special case we have received approval for discount form our Management .

 

A�ached you may find revised quota�on for Design-Expert so�ware.

 

Appreciate if you can raise PO at earliest.

 

Regards,

 

 

 

 

 

From: V V S Narayana Reddy K [mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, March 01, 2016 2:31 PM
To: SYSTECH TECHNOCARFT SERVICE PVT LTD <sales@systech.co.in>
Cc: K GOWTHAMARAJAN <gowthamsang@gmail.com>

mailto:sales@systech.co.in
http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx
http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx
mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com
mailto:sales@systech.co.in
mailto:gowthamsang@gmail.com


Subject: Re: Reg quotation for Statease sofware

 

Dear Sir,

Greetings from JSS College of Pharmacy,

We have received approval from our institute for the purchase of Design Expert software after possible effective price.

In this regard we request you to kindly revise the quoted price and provide best possible price with the invoice.

Waiting for your early reply.

Best Regards

 

On Thu, Feb 25, 2016 at 12:35 PM, SYSTECH TECHNOCARFT SERVICE PVT LTD <sales@systech.co.in> wrote:

Dear Narayana,

 

I hope you are doing good !

 

Appreciate if you can raise PO for Design –Expert so�ware.

 

Awai�ng for your responses .

 

Regards,

 

 

mailto:sales@systech.co.in
http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx
http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx


 

 

 

From: V V S Narayana Reddy K [mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, February 19, 2016 4:06 PM

To: SYSTECH TECHNOCARFT SERVICE PVT LTD <sales@systech.co.in>
Subject: Re: Reg quotation for Statease sofware

 

Dear Sir

The information is so helpful, Thank you

We will get back to you soon

Best Regards

 

On Fri, Feb 19, 2016 at 3:23 PM, SYSTECH TECHNOCARFT SERVICE PVT LTD <sales@systech.co.in> wrote:

Dear Narayana,

 

The Design Expert So�ware is perpetual has no expiry date, while the current license has 1st year of support and
maintenance whereby you will get any minor release, bug fixing , remote support and telephonic support.

 

If you wish to renew support a�er 1st year then Annual support is 20% of list/MRSP price which will again all support as
men�oned above including new release, however if you don't wish to renew the support the so�ware will s�ll con�nue
to work and will never expire.

 

The advantage of renewing support and maintenance is you get regular update and latest version along with technical
assistance in event of so�ware/system crash.

 

Let me know if you have any ques�on.

 

Regards,

 

 

mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com
mailto:sales@systech.co.in
mailto:sales@systech.co.in


 

 

 

From: V V S Narayana Reddy K [mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, February 19, 2016 3:15 PM
To: SYSTECH TECHNOCARFT SERVICE PVT LTD <sales@systech.co.in>
Subject: Re: Reg quota�on for Statease sofware

 

Dear Sir

Thank you for the swift reply, we have received your quotations and currently we are working on that.

May i know is the license is for lifetime or not and what is the meaning of Annual Service & Maintenance.

Best Regards

 

 

On Fri, Feb 19, 2016 at 3:06 PM, SYSTECH TECHNOCARFT SERVICE PVT LTD <sales@systech.co.in> wrote:

Dear Narayana Reddy K,

 

Thanks for you are inquiry for Design-Expert so�ware. SYSTECH is sole Aurothized Distributor in India.

 

As discussed on call ,please find a�ached formal quota�on for Design-Expert so�ware along with authorized le�er.

 

Here are few Academic Ins�tutes who had purchased Design-Expert so�ware from SYSTECH.

 

1. Na�onal Ins�tute of Technology- Hyderabad
2. Allana College of Pharmacy
3. Na�onal Dairy Research Ins�tute-
4. Central Mechanical Engineering Research Ins�tute
5. Central Salt& Marine Chemical Research Ins�tute.
6. Sahumaharah University
7. Na�onal Centre for Agriculture Economics
8. Thapar university
9. Defence Research Establishment

10. Guru Nanak college
11. Anna University
12. Jadavpur University
13. Sant Longowal Ins�tute of Engineering & Technology (SLIET)
14. Indian Ins�tute of Technology Durgapur
15. Na�onal Ins�tute of Pharmaceu�cal Educa�on and Research
16. K.M.Kundnani College of Pharmacy

http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx
http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx
mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com
mailto:sales@systech.co.in
mailto:sales@systech.co.in


17. University of North Bengal
18. Birla Ins�tute of Technology & Science (BITS)-Pilani, Hyderabad Campus
19. Indian Ins�tute of Technology Bombay
20. Ramanbhai Patel College of Pharmacy,
21. Annamalai University,
22. BITS Pilani- K.K. Birla Goa Campus
23. Vidyasagar University
24. Netaji Subhash Ins�tute of Technology
25. Bharathidasan University
26. Sardar Swaran Singh Na�onal Ins�tute of Renewable Energy
27. Na�onal Dairy Research Ins�tute (NDRI)
28. SND College Of Pharmacy
29. R.V.College of Engineering
30. KMK College of Pharmacy

31.   Government College of Pharmacy

32.   Appasaheb Birnale College of Pharmacy

33.   Na�onal Ins�tute of Technology Warangal

34.   Na�onal Ins�tute of Technology Calicut.

 

Appreciate if you can acknowledge and raise PO ASAP.

 

Let us know if you have any ques�on we will be glad to assist.

 

Regards,

 

 

http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx
http://www.systechglobal.co.in/DOE-March2016.aspx


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: V V S Narayana Reddy K [mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, February 19, 2016 10:56 AM
To: sales@systech.co.in
Cc: K GOWTHAMARAJAN <gowthamsang@gmail.com>
Subject: Reg quota�on for Statease sofware

 

Dear Sir/Madam

Greetings from JSS College of Pharmacy, Ooty.

As per our telephonic discussion happen on today morning, we would request you to provide a quotation in the name of
The Principal,  JSS College of Pharmacy, ooty for Design-Expert software for a single system alone and for 10
systems separately.

Please note that the software is for academic purposes but not for industry or commercialization.

The college address is

JSS College of Pharmacy 
(JSS University, Mysore)

Udhagamandalam- 643 001

India.

Waiting for your reply

Best Regards

--

Karri.V.V.S.Narayana Reddy., M.Pharm., (Ph.D).
INSPIRE Fellow (Department of Science and Technology)
Ph.D Research Scholar (Dept of Pharmaceutics)

JSS College of Pharmacy 
(JSS University, Mysore)

Udhagamandalam- 643 001

India.

Mobile: 09952478866 (TN)

--

Karri.V.V.S.Narayana Reddy., M.Pharm., (Ph.D).
INSPIRE Fellow (Department of Science and Technology)
Ph.D Research Scholar (Dept of Pharmaceutics)

JSS College of Pharmacy 
(JSS University, Mysore)

Udhagamandalam- 643 001

India.

Mobile: 09952478866 (TN)

mailto:satya.zeal@gmail.com
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mailto:gowthamsang@gmail.com


--

Karri.V.V.S.Narayana Reddy., M.Pharm., (Ph.D).
INSPIRE Fellow (Department of Science and Technology)
Ph.D Research Scholar (Dept of Pharmaceutics)

JSS College of Pharmacy 
(JSS University, Mysore)

Udhagamandalam- 643 001

India.

Mobile: 09952478866 (TN)

--

http://www.jsscpooty.org/node/279

https://www.researchgate.net/profile/Veera_Venkata_Satyanarayana_Reddy_Karri

Karri V V S Narayana Reddy.,
M.Pharm., (Ph.D)
Lecturer,
Dept of Pharmaceutics
JSS College of Pharmacy 
(JSS University, Mysore)
Udhagamandalam- 643 001
India.
M: +91 9952478866

 

--

http://www.jsscpooty.org/node/279

https://www.researchgate.net/profile/Veera_Venkata_Satyanarayana_Reddy_Karri

Karri V V S Narayana Reddy.,
M.Pharm., (Ph.D)
Lecturer,
Dept of Pharmaceutics
JSS College of Pharmacy 
(JSS University, Mysore)
Udhagamandalam- 643 001
India.
M: +91 9952478866

 

--

http://www.jsscpooty.org/node/279

https://www.researchgate.net/profile/Veera_Venkata_Satyanarayana_Reddy_Karri

Karri V V S Narayana Reddy., M.Pharm.,
(Ph.D)
Lecturer,
Dept of Pharmaceutics
JSS College of Pharmacy 
(JSS University, Mysore)
Udhagamandalam- 643 001
India.
M: +91 9952478866
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